

FOI/26/8396/B

I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act (2000) to ask that...

**Please provide the following information for the calendar year 2025, from 1 January 2025 to 31 December 2025. If full-year 2025 data is not yet available, please provide the latest available 2025 data and state the date range covered.**

**For sexual offences where an individual was charged, summonsed, postal requisitioned, or otherwise proceeded against, please provide:**

**1. The total number of cases/offences/proceedings recorded.**

**2. A breakdown by nationality as recorded by the force.**

**3. A summary breakdown showing:**

**a. British national;**

**b. foreign national;**

**c. unknown / not recorded / refused.**

**4. Where held, a breakdown by detailed offence type or Home Office offence classification.**

**5. A short explanation of the counting basis used, for example whether the figures count individuals, arrests, offences, custody records, charges, proceedings, or another category.**

**Where any nationality has fewer than 5 results, please suppress the exact figure and mark it as "<5".**

**For clarity, I am requesting aggregate statistical data only. I am not requesting names, addresses, dates of birth, victim information, case summaries, or free-text crime reports.**

01/01/202531/12/2025



Q1 & Q4. Count of Occurrence Numbers for Recorded Crime of Sexual Offences with Outcome 1: Charged and 1: Summonsed/postal requisition

Year Number	Count of Occurrence Number
2025	151
017/15/01 Sex - Sexual assault on a male - SOA 2003	5
017/16/01 Sex - Assault a boy under 13 by touching - SOA 2003	4
020/03/01 Sex - Assault a female 13 and over by penetration with part of body / a thing - SOA 2003	2
020/04/01 Sex - Assault a girl under 13 by penetration with a part of your body / a thing - SOA 2003	1
020/05/01 Sex - Sexual assault on a female - SOA 2003	58
020/06/01 Sex - Assault a girl under 13 by touching - SOA 2003	7
021/02/01 Sex - Offender of any age cause / incite a girl under 13 to engage in sexual activity - penetration - SOA 2003	2
021/03/01 Sex - Offender of any age cause / incite a girl under 13 to engage in sexual activity - no penetration - SOA 2003	1
021/14/01 Sex - Offender under 18 cause / incite a girl under 13 to engage in sexual activity - penetration - SOA 2003	1
021/24/01 Sex - Offender under 18 cause / incite a girl under 13 to engage in sexual activity - no penetration - SOA 2003	1
021/26/01 Sex - Arrange / facilitate the rape / assault by penetration of a child under 13	1
022/06/01 Sex - Offender 18 or over engage in penetrative sexual activity with a girl 13 to 15 - SOA 2003	3
022/08/01 Sex - Offender 18 or over cause / incite a girl 13 to 15 to engage in sexual activity - penetration - SOA 2003	1
022/12/01 Sex - Offender under 18 engage in penetrative sexual activity with a girl 13 to 15 - SOA 2003	1
022/18/01 Sex - Offender 18 or over engage in non penetrative sexual activity with girl 13 to 15 - SOA 2003	3
022/20/01 Sex - Offender 18 or over cause / incite a girl 13 to 15 to engage in sexual activity - no penetration - SOA 2003	1
022/21/01 Sex - Offender 18 or over cause / incite a boy 13 to 15 to engage in sexual activity - no penetration - SOA 2003	1
023/14/01 Sex - Adult sexual activity with a girl under 13 family member - penetration - SOA 2003	1
023/22/01 Sex - Adult sexual activity with a girl 13 - 17 family member - no penetration - SOA 2003	3
023/24/01 Sex - Adult sexual activity with a girl under 13 family member - no penetration - SOA 2003	1
071/01/01 Sex - Arrange / facilitate the commission of a child sex offence - SOA 2003	2
071/08/01 Sex - Cause / incite the sexual exploitation of a child 13 - 17 - SOA 2003	1
071/10/01 Sex - Arrange / facilitate the sexual exploitation of a child 13 - 17 - SOA 2003	1
071/12/01 Sex - Control a child under 13 subject to sexual exploitation - SOA 2003	1
071/17/01 Engage in sexual communication with a child	7
088/01/01 Sex - Adult meet girl under 16 following sexual grooming - SOA 2003	2
088/06/01 Sex - Commit an offence with the intention of committing a relevant sexual offence - SOA 2003	2
088/07/01 Sex - Knowingly / recklessly trespassed on premises with intent to commit a relevant sexual offence - SOA 2003	1
088/09/01 Sex - Exposure - SOA 2003	25
088/10/01 Sex - Voyeurism - install equipment / construct / adapt a structure - SOA 2003	1
088/10/02 Sex - Voyeurism - recording a private act - SOA 2003	6
088/10/04 Sex - Voyeurism - observing - SOA 2003	2
088/15/01 Sex - Sharing intimate photograph or film without consent to cause alarm, distress or humiliation, of subject or for sexual gratification of any person	1
088/15/02 Sex - Threaten to share intimate photograph or film to cause alarm distress or humiliation to subject of image	1
Total	151

Please note:

- Crime Tree LV4 Description - Other Sexual Offences used.
- Crime category used = Valid crime.
- Date range used = 01/01/2025 to 31/12/2025.
- Q1 and Q4 = count of occurrence number.
- Q2, Q3a,b, and c = count of nominal ID suspect/offender.
- Outcomes = count of occurrence number.
- Owning Agency Derbyshire.

Q2. Count of Nominal ID for Suspect/Offender for Recorded Crime of Sexual Offences with Outcome 1: Charged and 1: Summonsed/postal requisition with Suspect/Offender - All Citizenship

Year Number	Count of Nominal ID
2025	113
	109
AFG,IRE	1
CYP	1
GHA	1
IND	2
IRE	1
LIB	1
LIT	1
OTH	7
PAK	1
POL	3
SPA	1
SRI	1
SUD	2
UKA	89
UKA,IND	1
UKA,OTH	4
UKA,UKE	2
UKE	37
UKE,OTH	1
UKR	2
Total	113

Q3a. Count of Nominal ID for Suspect/Offender for Recorded Crime of Sexual Offences with Outcome 1: Charged and 1: Summonsed/postal requisition with Suspect/Offender - British Citizenship

Year Number	Count of Nominal ID
2025	98
UKA	89
UKE	37
Total	98

Q3b. Count of Nominal ID for Suspect/Offender for Recorded Crime of Sexual Offences with Outcome 1: Charged and 1: Summonsed/postal requisition with Suspect/Offender - Foreign Citizenship

Year Number	Count of Nominal ID
2025	19
AFG,IRE	1
CYP	1
GHA	1
IND	2
IRE	1
LIB	1
LIT	1
PAK	1
POL	3
SPA	1
SRI	1
SUD	2
UKA,IND	1
UKA,UKE	2
UKR	2
Total	19

Q3c. Count of Nominal ID for Suspect/Offender for Recorded Crime of Sexual Offences with Outcome 1: Charged and 1: Summonsed/postal requisition with Suspect/Offender - unknown/not recorded/refused - Citizenship

Year Number	Count of Nominal ID
2025	110
	109
OTH	7
UKA,OTH	4
UKE,OTH	1
Total	110